
LC 
12/ 16/21 
Item No. 8 

ORDINANCE ·2·0 21 - 1 2 - 1 6 - O 9 6 5 
APPROVING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS ESTABLISHING UNIT 
PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED ANNUAL 
COST OF $4,827,000.00, INCLUDED IN THE RESPECTIVE 
DEPARTMENT'S FY 2022 ADOPTED BUDGET: (A) HLP, INC., FOR 
MAINTENANCE AND SUPPORT FOR THE CHAMELEON SHELTER 
SOFTWARE CASE MANAGEMENT SYSTEM FOR ANIMAL CARE 
SERVICES; (B) GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC., AND PRECISION DEL TA 
CORPORATION FOR AMMUNITION FOR THE SAN ANTONIO POLICE 
DEPARTMENT AND OTHER LAW ENFORCEMENT OFFICERS; AND 
(C) WEX BANK FOR A FLEET FUELING CARD SYSTEM FOR THE SAN 
ANTONIO FIRE DEPARTMENT. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, the City is able to obtain significant savings by purchasing various materials and 
services on an annual contract basis; and 

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves contracts with (A) HLP, Inc. , for maintenance and support 
for the Chameleon Shelter Software Case Management System for Animal Care Services; (B) GT 
Distributors, Inc. , and Precision Delta Corporation for ammunition for the San Antonio Police 
Department (SAPD) and other law enforcement officers; and (C) Wex Bank for a Valero fleet 
fueling card system for the San Antonio Fire Department (SAFD); and 

WHEREAS, the Texas Local Government Code indicates that competitive bidding is not required 
under section 252.022(a)(7)(A), which provides for any items that are available only from a sole 
source of supply; and 

WHEREAS, the Texas Local Government Code indicates that competitive bidding is not required 
under section 252.022(a)(2), which provides for a procurement necessary to protect the public 
health or safety; and 

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year's budget 
approved by City Council ; NOW THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The following bids to furnish the City with goods and services on an annual basis 
as shown on the attached bid tabulation sheets are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon 
the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements: 
(A) HLP, Inc ., for maintenance and support for the Chameleon Shelter Software Case Management 
System for Animal Care Services; (8) GT Distributors, Inc., and Precision Delta Corporation for 
ammunition for SAPD and other law enforcement officers; and (C) Wex Bank for a Valero fleet 
fueling card system for SAFD. The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto and incorporated 
herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are available for inspection in the offices 
of the Purchasing Division of the Finance Department. 
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sic ION 2-. Furt9s will be enc'umbered upon issuance of purchase orders, and payment is 
a thorized to' the vendors identified herein. All expenditures will be in accordance with the Fiscal 
Year 2022 budget, and such other appropriations necessary to fund the contracts through their 
terms as evidenced by subsequent ordinances. 

SECTION 3. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes; 
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage. 

PASSED and APPROVED this 16th day of December, 2021. 

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

~ ,/uc4- tk~ 
Debbie Racca-Sittre, Acting City Clerk ~ Attorney 

2 



8. 

City of San Antonio 

City Council Meeting 
December 16, 2021 

2021-12-16-0965 
Ordinance approving the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services for an 

estimated annual cost of $4,827,000.00, included in the respective department's FY 2022 

Adopted Budget: (A) HLP, Inc., for Chameleon Shelter Software Case Management System 
maintenance and support for Animal Care Services; (B) GT Distributors, Inc., and Precision Delta 

Corporation for ammunition for the San Antonio Police Depmtment and other law enforcement 

officers; and (C) Wex Bank for a fleet fueling card system for the San Antonio Fire Department. 

[Ben Gorzell Jr., Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance] 

Councilmember Courage moved to Approve on the Consent Agenda. Counci]member Cabello 

Havrda seconded the motion. The motion carried by the following vote: 

Aye: Nirenberg, Bravo, McKee-Rodriguez, Viagran, Rocha Garcia, Castillo, Cabello 

Havrda, Sandoval, Pelaez, Courage, Perry 
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Exhibit I 



Open: 

For: 

November 12, 2021 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Annual Contract for Chameleon Shelter Software Maintenance & 
Support for ACS 

6100013236 

Item Description 

1 Chameleon I CMS Unlimited Annual Support & Maintenance 

January 1, 2022 - December 31 , 2022 
January 1, 2023 - December 31 , 2023 
January 1, 2024 - December 31 , 2024 
Renewal 1 January 1, 2025 - December 31 , 2025 
Renewal 2 January 1, 2026 - December 31 , 2026 

2 Live Checker Interface Annual Certified Data Connection Support & 
Maintenance 

January 1, 2022 - December 31 , 2022 
January 1 , 2023 - December 31 , 2023 
January 1, 2024 - December 31 , 2024 
Renewal 1 January 1, 2025 - December 31 , 2025 
Renewal 2 January 1, 2026 - December 31 , 2026 

3 Annual Certified Data Connection Support & Maintenance -
Chameleon I CMS and San Antonio 311 Interface 

January 1, 2022 - December 31 , 2022 
January 1, 2023 - December 31 , 2023 
January 1, 2024 - December 31 , 2024 
Renewal 1 January 1, 2025 - December 31 , 2025 
Renewal 2 January 1, 2026 - December 31 , 2026 

Terms 

Estimated Total 
Estimated Total Award 

Page 1 of 1 

Exhibit I 

Sole Source 

HLP, Inc. 
9888 West Belleview 

VF Ave #110 

Annual 
Littleton, 
co 80123 

Quantity 800-459-8376 

1 $24,000.00 
1 $24,000.00 
1 $24,000.00 
1 $24,000.00 
1 $24,000.00 

1 $960.00 
1 $960.00 
1 $960.00 
1 $960.00 
1 $960.00 

1 $1 ,920.00 
1 $1 ,920.00 
1 $1 ,920.00 
1 $1 ,920.00 
1 $1 ,920.00 

Net 30 

$134,400 .00 
$134 400.00 



Opened: October 1, 2021 

For: Annual Contract For Ammunition For SAPD And Other Law 
Enforcement Officers 

610001 3583 

Item Description 

ITEM# 1 -STANDARD AMMUNITION-SPEER BULLETS, PART 
#53955- TRAINING-LAWM AN, .40 S&W, .165GR.TMJ 

1 Speer Bullet, Part# 53955 
Lawman, .40 S&W, 165gr. TMJ 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

SUBSTITUTE AM MUNITION FOR: 
ITEM# 1A -SPEER BULLETS, PART# 53955- TRAINING-
LAWMAN, .40 S7W, 165 GR. TM J - "Preferred Grain weight 
.165-. 185 

1.1 Speer .180gr. Part# CCl53652 
Lawman, .40 S&W, 165gr -.185gr TMJ 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 

Vendor Part# 
Grain weight 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

1.2 Speer .165gr. Part# 53955 
Lawman, .40 S&W, 165gr-.185gr TMJ 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Grain weight 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

1.3 Federal .180gr, Part# FC-AE40R1 
American Eagle, .40 S&W, 165gr -.185gr TMJ 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Grain weight 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 

Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

1.4 Federal .165gr, Part# FC-AE40R1 
American Eagle, .40 S&W, 165gr -.185gr TMJ 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Grain weight 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

City of San Antonio 
Bid T abula tion 

Non-Local 

GT Distributors, Inc. 

AAS 2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 

Estimated Austin , 

Annual TX 78758 

Quantity 800-252-8310 

2272 

Speer 
53955 

CCl-53955 
1000 

0.28549 
$285.49 

$648,633.28 
365 Days 

1 

Speer 
53652 

CCl-53652 
.180gr 

1000 
0.33365 
$333.65 
$333.65 

365 Days 

1 

Speer 
53955 

CCl-53955 
.165 gr 

1000 
0.28549 
S285.49 
S285.49 

365 Days 

1 

Federal 
AE40R1 

FC-AE40R1 
.180gr 

1000 
0.34396 
$343.96 
$343.96 

365 Days 

1 

Federal 
AE40R1 

FC-AE40R1 
.165gr 

1000 
0.34396 
S343.96 
$343.96 

365 Davs 

BuyBoard Non-Local 

GT Distributors, Inc. Precision Delta Corporation 

2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 205 Floyce St. 

Austin , Ruleville 

TX 78758 MS 38771 

800-252-8310 662-756-2810 

No Bid 

Speer 

53955 
CCl-53955 

1000 
0.65479 
$654.79 

$1,487,682.88 
365 Days 

Speer No Bid 

53652 
CCl-53652 

.180gr 
1000 

0.65479 
$654.79 
$654.79 

365 Days 

Speer No Bid 
53955 

CCl-53955 
.165 gr 

1000 
0.65479 
$654.79 
$654.79 

365 Days 

Federal No Bid 
AE40R1 

FC-AE40R1 
.180gr 

1000 
0.64726 
$647.26 
$647.26 

365 Days 

Federal No Bid 
AE40R3 

FC-AE40R3 
.165gr 

1000 
0.64726 
$647.26 
$647.26 

365 Days 



Opened : October 1, 2021 

For: Annual Contract For Ammunition For SAPD And Other Law 
Enforcement Officers 

61 0001358 3 

Item Description 

1.5 Hornady .175gr, Part# 91374 
FMJ Training Base .165gr-.185gr 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Grain welght 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

1.6 Hornady .165gr, Part# 91375 

FMJ Training Base .165gr -.185gr 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Grain weight 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

1.7 Winchester .180gr, Part# WC402 

Super X .165gr -.185gr 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Grain weight 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

1.8 Winchester .165gr, Part# WC401 
Super X .165gr-.185gr 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Grain weight 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

1.9 Remington , .180gr, Part# RA-L40SW3 

UMC .165gr-.185gr 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Grain weight 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Ta bula tion 

Non-Local 
GT Distributors, Inc. 

AAS 2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 
Estimated Austin , 

Annual TX 78758 
Quantity 800-252-8310 

1 

Hornady 
91374 
91374 
.175gr 

1000 
0.56114 
$561 .14 
$561 .14 

365 Days 

1 

Hornady 
91375 
91375 
.175gr 

1000 
0.63171 
$631 .71 
$631 .71 

365 Days 

1 

No Bid 

1 

No Bid 

1 

Remington 
23742 
23742 
180gr 
1000 

0.38982 
$389.82 
$389.82 

365 Days 

BuyBoard Non-Local 
GT Distributors, Inc. Precision Delta Corporation 

2545 Brockton Or. Suite 100 205 Floyce St. 
Austin , Ruleville 
TX 78758 MS 38771 
800-252-8310 662-756-2810 

Homady No Bid 
91374 
91374 
.175gr 

1000 
0.66406 
$664.06 
$664.06 

365 Days 

Homady No Bid 
91375 
91375 
.175gr 

1000 
0.51437 
$514.37 
$514.37 

365 Days 

No Bid Winchester 
WC402 

Winchester WC402 
.180 gr 

1000 
0.284 

$284.00 
$284.00 

365 Days 

No Bid Winchester 
WC401 

Winchester WC401 
16591 
1000 

0.289 
$289.00 
$289.00 

365 Days 

No Bid No Bid 



Opened : October 1, 2021 

For: Annual Contract For Am munition For SAPO And Other Law 
Enforcement Off icers 

610001 3583 

Item Desc ription 

1.10 Remington, .165gr, Part# L40SW4237 46 

UMC .165gr -.185gr 

Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Grain weight 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

1.11 Deleted 

1.12 Deleted 

1.13 Deleted 

1.14 Deleted 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Ta bulation 

Non-Local 

GT Distributors, Inc. 

AAS 2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 
Estimated Austin , 

Annual TX 78758 
Quantit v 800-252-8310 

1 

Remington 
L40SW23746 

23746 
.165gr 

1000 
0.38982 
$389.82 
$389.82 

365 Days 

BuyBoard Non-Local 

GT Distributors, Inc. Precision Delta Corporation 

2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 205 Floyce St. 

Austin , Ruleville 
TX 78758 MS 38771 
800-252-8310 662-756-2510 

No Bid No Bid 



Opened: October 1, 2021 

For: Annual Contract For Ammunition For SAP• And Other Law 
Enforcement Officers 

6100013583 

Item Description 

1.15 Speer, CCI .180gr, Part#CCI 5220 
Blazer, Any grain weight .168gr-.185gr 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Grain weight 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

1.16 Speer, CCI .165gr, Part# CCl-5210 
Blazer, Any grain weight .168gr-. 185gr 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Grain weight 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

ITEM# 2 - STANDARD AMMUNITION-SPEER BULLETS, PART 
# 53970-LE GOLD DOT DUTY, .40 S&W, .165GR. GDHP 

2 Speer Bullet, Part# 53970 
.40 S&W, .165gr GDHP 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

SUBSTITUTE AMMUNITION FOR: ITEM # 2A -SPEER 
BULLETS, PART# 53970-LE GOLD DOT DUTY, .40 S&W, 
165GR. GDHP 

2.1 Homady, 91375 
.40 Caliber, .175gr, Critical Duty, Flex Lock 

Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Grain weight 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

2.2 Winchester, Part# RA40BA 

.40 Caliber, .16SgrDefender Ranger Bonded 
Manufacture Name: 

Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 

Grain weight 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Non-Local 

GT Distributors, Inc. 

AAS 2545 Brockton Or. Suite 100 

Estimated Austin , 
Annual TX 78758 

Quantity 800-252-8310 

1 

Speer 
CCl-5220 

5220 
.180gr . 1000 
0.3302 

$330.20 
$330.20 

365 Days 

1 

Speer 
CCl-5210 

23742 
.180gr 

1000 
0.3302 

$330.20 
$330.20 

365 Days 

285 

Speer 
53970 

CCl-53970 
1000 

0.45048 
$450.48 

$128,386.80 
365 Days 

1 

Homady 
91375 

91375 
0.175 
1000 

0.63171 
$631 .71 
$631 .71 

365 Days 

1 

No Bid 

BuyBoard Non-Local 

GT Distributors, Inc. Precision Delta Corporation 

2545 Brockton Or. Suite 100 205 Floyce St. 

Austin , Ruleville 
TX 78758 MS 38771 

800-252-8310 662-756-2810 

Speer No Bid 
CCl-5220 

5220 
.180gr 

1000 
0.60613 
$606.13 
$606.13 

365 Days 

Speer No Bid 
CCl-5210 

23742 
.180gr 

1000 
0.60613 
$606.13 
$606.13 

365 Days 

No Bid 

Speer 
53970 

CCl-53970 
1000 

0.98841 
$988.41 

$281 ,696.85 
365 Days 

Homady No Bid 
91375 

91375 
0.175 
1000 

0.51437 
$514.37 
$514.37 

365 Days 

No Bid Winchester 
RA40BA 

Winchester RA40BA 
.165gr 

1000 
0.399 

$399.00 
$399.00 
72 Davs 



Opened : October 1, 2021 

For: Annual Contract For Ammunition For SAPD And Other Law 

Enforcement Officers 

6100013583 

Item Description 

2.3 Federal, Part# P40HS3G 
.40 Caliber, .165gr Hydra-shok 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part # 
Grain weight 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time ln Days 

2.4 Remington, Part# HD40SWA28957 
.40 Caliber, .165gr UMC , Ultimate Defense Handgun 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufa cturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part # 
Grain weight 

Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

ITEM# 3-20 : STANDARD AMMUNITION 
3 Speer Bullet, Part# 53375 

.40 S&W, .125gr, RHT Frangible 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

4 Speer Bullet, Part # 53650 
9mm Luger, Lawman, .11 Sgr. TMJ 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

5 Speer Bullet, Part # 53617 
9mm Luger +P, .124gr. GDHP, LE Gold Dot Duty 
Manufacture Name· 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Case 
Lead Time In Days 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabula tion 

Non-Local 

GT Distributors , Inc. 

AAS 2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 

Estimated Austin, 

Annual TX 78758 

Quantity 800-252-8310 

1 

Federal 
P40HS3G 
P40HS3G 

No response 
1000 

0.46913 
$469.13 
$469.13 

365 Days 

1 

Remingtor 
2895 
2895 

No respons 
100 

1.1373 
$1 ,137.3 
$1,137 .3 
365 Days 

3 

Speer 
5337E 

CCl-5337E 
100C 

053~~l 
$533.8 

$1,601 .5 
365 Da 

15 

Spee, 
5365C 

CCl-536: 
10 

0.265 
$265. 

$3,975.! 
365 Da! 

5 

Speer 

536: 
CC l-5361 

100( 
365 DaI 

0.3994 
$399.4 

$1,997.2 
3cc n., 

BuyBoard Non-Local 

GT Distributors, Inc. Precision Delta Corporation 

2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 205 Floyce St. 

Austin, Ruleville 

TX 78758 MS 38771 

800-252-8310 662-756-2810 

Federal No Bid 
P40HS3G 
P40HS3G 

No response 
1000 

0.97161 
$971 .61 
$971.61 

365 Days 

No Bid No Bid 

Speer No Bid 
53375 

CCl-53375 
1000 

1.0081 
$1 ,008.10 
$3,024.30 
365 Days 

No Bid No Bid 

Speer No Bid 
53617 

CCl-53617 
1000 

365 Days 
0.91021 
$910.21 

$4,551 .05 
365 Days 



Opened: October 1, 2021 

For: Annual Contract For Ammunition For SAPD And Other Law 
Enforcement Officers 

6100013583 

Item Description 

6 Speer Bullet, Part# 53720 
38 Special +P, .125gr. GDHP, LE Gold Dot Duty 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

7 Federal , Part# T223A 
Tactical Tru, .223 Rem, 55gr. , Hi Shok 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

8 Federal, Part# AE223 
American Eagle, .223 Rem 55gr. , FMJ 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

9 Federal , Part# BC223NT5A (Discontinued) 
RTH .223 Rem. ,55gr. RHT (Frangible) 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

10 Federal, Part# GM308M 
Gold Medal, .308 Win. 168gr. , Sierra MatchKing BTHP 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Non-Local 
GT Distributors, Inc. 

AAS 2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 

Estimated Austin, 
Annual TX 78758 

Quantity 800-252-8310 

1 

Spee, 
53720 

CCl-53720 
1000 

0.47412 
$474.12 
$474.12 

365 Days 

248 

Federal 
T223A 

FC-T223A 
1000 

0.5351 
$535.10 

$132,704.80 
365 Days 

1458 

Federal 
AE223 

FC-AE223 
1000 

0.43398 
$433.98 

$632 ,742 .84 
365 Days 

4 
Alternate Part# 

Federal 
FC-BC556NX1 ; 50gr 

FC-BC556NX1 
1000 

0.67695 
$676.95 

$2,707.80 
365 Days 

15 

Federal 
GM308M 

FC-GM308M 
1000 

1.11372 
$1 ,113.72 

$16,705.80 
365 Days 

BuyBoard Non-Local 
GT Distributors, Inc. Precision Delta Corporation 

2545 Brockton Or. Suite 100 205 Floyce St. 

Austin , Ruleville 
TX 78758 MS 38771 
800-252-8310 662-756-2810 

Speer No Bid 
53720 

CCl-53720 
1000 

0.91021 
$910.21 
$910.21 

365 Days 

Federal No Bid 
T223A 

FC-T223A 
1000 

1.27858 
$1 ,278.58 

$317,087.84 
365 Days 

Federal No Bid 
AE223 

FC-AE223 
1000 

0.86808 
$868.08 

$1 ,265,660.64 
365 Days 

Alternate Part# 
Federal No Bid 

FC-BC556NX1 ; 50gr 
FC-BC556NX1 

1000 
1.94684 

$1 ,946.84 
$7,787.36 
365 Days 

No Bid 
Federal 

GM308M 
FC-GM308M 

1000 
2.1539 

$2 ,153.90 
$32 ,308.50 

365 Days 



Opened : October 1, 2021 

For: Annual Contract For Ammunit ion For SAPD And Other Law 
Enforcement Officers 

610001 3583 

Item Description 

11 Federal, Part# LE12700 
Tactical Buckshot ,12ga. ,00 Buck (9 pellets) 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

12 Federal, Part# LEB127 RS 
Tactical TruBall Rifled Slug, 12ga., 1oz. Rifled Slug 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

13 Federal, Part# T116 7.5 
Birdshot, 12ga., 7 .5 Birds hot 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

14 Defense Technology, Part# DT-3027 
Drag Stabilized Bean Bag, 12ga. 40 gram 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Pack 
Price Per Round 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

15 Defense Technology, Part# DT-3105 
TKO Breaching , 12ga. 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Each 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

16 Force on Force, Part# FF9R2 
Simunition 9mm FOF Marker Round Red 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Ta bulation 

Non-Local 
GT Distributors, Inc. 

AAS 2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 

Estimated Austin, 
Annual TX 78758 

Quantity 800-252-8310 

672 

Federal 
LE12700 

FC-LE12700 
1000 

0.70683 
$706.83 

$474,989.76 
365 Days 

155 

Federal 
LEB127RS 

FC-LEB127RS 
1000 

0.73171 
$731 .71 

$113,415.05 
365 Days 

3 

Federal 
T116 7.5 

FC-T1 16-7.5 
1000 

0.41287 
$412.87 

$1 ,238.61 
365 Days 

30,000 

Defense Technology 
DT-3027 
DT-3027 

5 Each 
$6.36 

$190,800.00 
120 Days 

4 

Defense Technology 
3105 TKO 

DT-3105 
$5.59 
$7.57 

$30.28 
120 Days 

19 

Force on Force 
FF9R2 

FOF-FF9R2 
1000 

0.69891 
$698.91 

$13,279.29 
365 Days 

Bu \l Board Non-Local 
GT Distributors, Inc. Precision Delta Corporation 

2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 205 Floyce St. 

Austin, Ruleville 
TX 78758 MS 38771 
800-252-8310 662-756-2810 

No Bid 
Federal 

LE12700 
FC-LE12700 

1000 
1.24238 

$1 ,242.38 
$834,879.36 

365 Days 

No Bid 
Federal 

LEB127RS 
FC-LEB127RS 

1000 
1.34664 

$1 ,346.64 
$208,729.20 

365 Days 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid 
Defense Technology 

DT-3027 
DT-3027 

5 Each 
$5.37 

$161 ,100.00 
120 Days 

No Bid 
Defense Technology 

3105 TKO 
DT-3105 

$5.45 
$5.45 

$21 .80 
120 Days 

No Bid 
Force on Force 

FF9R2 
FOF-FF9R2 

1000 
0.38665 
$386.65 

$7,346.35 
365 Davs 



Opened : October 1, 2021 

For: Annual Cont ract For Am munition For SAP• And Other Law 
Enforcement Officers 

6100013583 

Item Description 

17 Force on Force, Part# FF982 
Simunition 9mm FOF Marker Round Blue 

Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

18 Deleted 

19 Force on Force, Part# FF556R1 
Simunition 5.6mm, FOF Marker Round Red 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

20 Force on Force, Part# FF556B1 
Simunition 5.6mm , FOF Marker Round Blue 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

Sub-Total (Items 1-20) 

Warranty Item #s 1·20 

ITEM# 21-38: SPECIAL TY AM MUNITION FOR SWAT 
21 Defense Technology, Part# DT·8902NR 

Low Roll Distraction Device Non-Reloadable-1 Sgram 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Box 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Each 
Price Total 
Lead nme In Days 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabula tion 

Non-Local 
GT Distributors, Inc. 

AAS 2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 
Estimated Austin , 

Annual TX 78758 
Quantitv 800-252-8310 

20 

Force on Force 
FF9B2 

FOF-FF9B2 
1000 

0.69891 
$698.91 

$13,978.20 
365 Days 

3 

Force on Force 
FF556R1 

FOF-FF556R 1 
1000 

0.792889 
$792.89 

$2,378.67 
365 Days 

3 

Force on Force 
FF556B1 

FOF-FF556B1 
1000 

0.79289 
$792.89 

$2 ,378.67 
365 Days 

$2,388,862 .85 

1·5 Years 

100 

Defense Technology 
8902NR 

DT-8902NR 
1 

$69.86 
$69.86 

$6,986.00 
120 Days 

BuvBoard Non-Local 
GT Distributors, Inc. Precision Delta Corporation 

2545 Brockton Or. Suite 100 205 Floyce St 
Austin , Ruleville 
TX 78758 MS 38771 
800-252-8310 662-756-2810 

No Bid 

Force on Force 
FF9B2 

FOF-FF9B2 
1000 

0.38665 
$386.65 

$7 ,733.00 

365 Days 

No Bid 
Force on Force 

FF556R1 
FOF-FF556R1 

1000 
0.44604 
$446.04 

$1 ,338.12 
365 Days 

No Bid 
Force on Force 

FF556B1 
FOF-FF556B1 

1000 
0.44604 
$446.04 

S1 ,338.12 
365 Davs 

$4,629,942.35 

1·5 Years 1 Year 

No Bid 
Defense Technology 

8902NR 
DT-8902NR 

1 
$54.67 
$54.67 

$5,467.00 
120 Days 



Opened : October 1, 2021 

For: Annual Contract For Ammunit ion For SAPD And Other Law 
Enforcement Officers 

610001 3583 

Item Descript ion 

22 Defense Technology, Part# DT-1292 
Ferret 40mm Powder Barricade Round, CS, Barricade 
Penetrating , Projectile Powder-44mm 

Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Box 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Each 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

23 Defense Technology, Part# DT-6325LE 

exact iMpact 40mm Sponge Round Extend-44mm 

Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Box 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Each 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

24 Defense Technology, Part# DT-1032 
Flameless Tri-Chamber CS,Smoke, Grenades 

Manufacture Name: 

Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Box 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Each 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

25 Defense Technology, Part# DT-1050 
Aerosol Grenades OC/CS 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Box 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Each 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

26 Defense Technology, Part# DT-1192 
Ferret 37 mm Po'Nder Barricade Round, CS-37 mm 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Box 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Each 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

27 Defense Technology, Part# DT-1176 
Model 20W Wood Baton Rounds-37mm 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Box 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Each 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Non-Local 
GT Distributors, Inc. 

AAS 2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 

Estimated Austin , 
Annual TX 78758 

Quantitv 800-252-8310 

50 

Defense Technology 

2292 
DT-2292 

1 
$27.07 
$27.07 

$1 ,353.50 
120 Days 

50 

Defense Technology 
6325LE 

DT-6325LE 
1 

$28.71 
$28.71 

$1 ,435.50 
120 Davs 

100 

Defense Technology 

1032 
DT-1032 

1 
$45.29 
$45.29 

$4,529.00 
120 Days 

20 

Defense Technology 
1050 

DT-1050 

1 
$66.43 
$66.43 

$1 ,328.60 

120 Days 

100 

Defense Technology 
1192 

DT-1192 

1 
$26.29 
$26.29 

$2 ,629.00 
120 Days 

5 

Defense Technology 
1176 

DT-1176 
1 

$18.57 
$18.57 
$92 .85 

120 Days 

BuvBoard Non-Local 
GT Distributors, Inc. Precision Delta Corporation 

2545 Brockton Or. Suite 100 205 Floyce St. 

Austin , Ruleville 
TX 78758 MS 38771 
800-252-8310 662-756-2810 

Defense Technology No Bid 

2292 
DT-2292 

1 
$25.70 
$25.70 

$1 ,285.00 
120 Davs 

Defense Technology No Bid 
6325LE 

DT-6325LE 

1 
$29.26 
$29.26 

$1 ,463.00 
120 Days 

Defense Technology No Bid 

1032 
DT-1032 

1 
$38.17 
$38.17 

$3,817.00 
120 Days 

No Bid 
Defense Technology 

1050 
DT-1050 

1 
$49.64 
$49.64 

$992.80 

120 Days 

No Bid 
Defense Technology 

1192 
DT-1192 

1 
$23.66 
$23.66 

$2 ,366.00 
120 Days 

No Bid 
Defense Technology 

1176 
DT-1176 

1 
$18.53 
$18.53 
$92.65 

120 Davs 



Opened: October 1, 2021 

For: Annual Contract For Ammunition For SAPO And Other Law 
Enforcement Officers 

6100013583 

Item Description 

28 Defense Technology, Part# DT-6530 
Def Tech 40mm Reloadable 250-shot training kit 

Manufacture Name: 

Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Kit 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

29 Hornady, Part# 80896 
Hornady TA, .308 Win, Urban Precision-110 gr. 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 

Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Case 

Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 

Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

30 Hornady, Part# 80725 
.308 Win 168gr. ELD Maleh Tap 
Manufacture Name: 

Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 

Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 

Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

31 Hornady, Part# 90225 
9mm Luger+P, 135gr. Flex Lock 

Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 

Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Case 

Price Per Round 

Price Per Case 
Price Total 

Lead Time In Days 

32 Hornady, Part# 9760-LE-BX (Discontinued) 

Hornady - Lacquered Training Ammunition , .223 REM, .75gr 
Manufacture Name: 

Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

33 Hornady, Part# 81292-BX 
Hornady-5.56 NATO Training TAP SBR, .75gr 
Manufacture Name· 

Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 

Rounds Per Case 

Price Per Round 

Price Per Case 

Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Non-Local 
GT Distributors, Inc. 

AAS 2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 

Estimated Austin , 

Annual TX 78758 
\ 

Quantity 800-252-8310 

1 

Defense Technology 
DT-6530 
DT-6530 

1000 
1.34407 

S1 ,344.07 
S1 ,344.07 
120 Days 

2 

Hornady 
80896 

Hornady-80896 
1000 

1.50071 
$1 ,500.71 
$3,001.42 
365 Days 

2 

Hornady 
80725 

Hornady-80725 
1000 

1.50071 
$1 ,500.71 
$3,001.42 
365 Days 

2 

Hornady 

90225 
Homady-90225 

1000 
1.57929 

$1 ,579.29 
$3,158.58 
365 Days 

3 

Hornady 

FR320 5.56 .75gr 
Hornady-FR320 

1000 
0.73429 
$734.29 

$2,202.87 
365 Days 

3 

Hornady 
81292-8~ 

Hornady-81292-B~ 
1000 

0.68514 
$685.14 

$2,055.42 
365 Days 

BuvBoard Non-Local 
GT Distributors, Inc. Precision Delta Corporation 

2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 205 Floyce St. 

Austin , Ruleville 

TX 78758 MS 38771 

800-252-8310 662-756-2810 

Defense Technology No Bid 
DT-6530 
DT-6530 

1000 
1.11117 

$1 ,111 .17 
$1 ,111 .17 
120 Days 

Hornady No Bid 
80896 

Hornady-80896 
1000 

1.22191 
$1 ,221 .91 
$2,443.82 
365 Days 

Hornady No Bid 
80725 

Hornady-80725 
1000 

1.22191 
$1 ,221 .91 
$2,443.82 
365 Days 

Hornady No Bid 
90225 

Hornady-90225 
1000 

0.51437 
$514.37 

$1 ,028.74 
365 Days 

Hornady No Bid 
FR320 5.56 .75gr 

Hornady-FR320 
1000 

0.5953 
$595.30 

$1 ,785.90 
365 Days 

Hornady No Bid 
81292-BX 

Hornady-81292-BX 
1000 

0.55802 
$558.02 

$1 ,674.06 
365 Days 



Opened: October 1, 2021 

For: Annual Contract For Ammunition For SAP• And Other Law 
Enforcement Officers 

6100013583 

Item Description 

34 Federal, Part# GM308M2 
Gold Medal, Sierra MatchKing BTHP, .308 W in., .175gr 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

35 Federal, Part# FC-LE308TT2 
Federal Cartridge, .308 Win ,. 168gr Tactical 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

36 Pepperball Non-Lethal, Part# PBT-104-81-0375 
Pepperball Live-X Pava (OC) Round Powder Round Projecti les . 
. 68gr, 3 grams 
Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

37 Pepperball Non-Lethal, Part# 100-84-0375 
PBT Pepperball Inert 375 Count, .68gr, 3 grams 

Manufacture Name: 
Manufacturer Product Number: 
Vendor Part# 
Rounds Per Case 
Price Per Round 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Lead Time In Days 

38 Deleted 

Warranty - Item #s 1-38 

Shelf Life 

Payment Terms 

Sub-Total (Items 21 -38) 

Estimated Annual Total 
Estimated Annual Award 

Deleted Items. 1.11 - 1.14 and 18 will be re-bid ata later date. 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Non-Local 
GT Distributors, Inc. 

AAS 2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 

Estimated Austin, 
Annual TX 78758 

Quantity 800-252-8310 

1 

Federal 
GM308M2 

FC-GM308M2 
1000 

1.16976 
$1 ,169.76 
$1 ,169.76 
365 Days 

2 

Federal 
LE308TT2 

FC-LE308TT2 
1000 

1.76085 
$1 ,760.85 
$3,521 .70 
365 Days 

5 

Pepperball 
PBT-104-81-0375 
PBT-104-81-0375 

375 
3.10856 

$1 ,165.71 
$5,828.55 
180 Days 

5 

Pepperball 
100-84-0375 

PBT-100-84-0375 
375 

0.81907 
$307.15 

$1 ,535.75 
180 Days 

1-5 Years 

5 Years 

Net 30 

$45,173.99 

$2,434,036.84 
$2,165,923.82 

BuvBoard Non-Local 
GT Distributors, Inc. Precision Delta Corporation 

2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 205 Floyce St. 

Austin , Ruleville 
TX 78758 MS 38771 
800-252-8310 662-756-2810 

Federal No Bid 
GM308M2 

FC-GM308M2 
1000 

0.86156 
$861 .56 
$861 .56 

365 Days 

Federal No Bid 
LE308TT2 

FC-LE308TT2 
1000 

1.39732 
$1 ,397.32 
$2 ,794.64 
365 Days 

Pepperball No Bid 
PBT-104-81-0375 
PBT-104-81-0375 

375 
2.952106667 

$1 ,107.04 
$5,535.20 
180 Days 

Pepperball No Bid 
100-84-0375 

PBT-100-84-0375 
375 

0.77059 
$288.97 

$1 ,444.85 
180 Davs 

1-5 Years NIA 

5 Years N/A 

Net30 Net30 

$36,607.21 $972.00 

$4 ,666,549.56 $972.00 
$215,050.34 $972.00 



Opened: 

For: 

6100014365 

Item 

1 

2 

October 6, 2021 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

SAFD-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SAFD FLEET FUELING CARD 
SYSTEM 

AAS 

Estimated 

Description Annual 

Quantity 

Ultra-Low Sulfur No.2 Diesel Fuel 575,000 
Primary BrandfTrade Name 
Per Gallon Discount of Upcharge 
Upcharge Price Per Gallon 
OPIS Composite Prices/NAGS Code 001 For October 6, 2021 
SUB-TOTAL 

Federal Excise Tax 
State Tax per Gallon 
Base Price Per Gallon 

State Environmental/Delivery Fee 
Federal Environmental Fee 
Federal Lust Fee 
Total Fees 
Total Cost Per Gallon (Base Price + Total Fees) 
Total Cost 

Unleaded Regular Gasoline 110,000 
Per Gallon Discount of Upcharge 
Upcharge Price Per Gallon 
OPIS Composite Prices NAGS Code 019 For October 6, 2021 
SUB-TOTAL 

Federal Excise Tax 
State Tax 
Base Price Per Gallon 

State Environmental/Delivery Fee 
Federal Environmental Fee 
Federal Lust Fee 
Total Fees 
Total Cost Per Gallon (Base Price+ Total Fees) 
Total Cost 

Payment Terms 
Estimated Annual Total 
Estimated Annual Award 

Non-Local Non-Local 
Wex Bank (Valero) Wex Bank (Exxon Mobile) 

111 East Sego Lilly Drive, Suite 250 111 East Sego Lilly Drive, Suite 250 

Sandy Sandy 

UT, 84070 UT, 84070 

888-842-0075 

Valero Exxon Mobil 
Upcharge Upcharge 

$0.080( $0.1175 
$2.359E $2.3598 
$2.439E $2.4773 

$0.2440 $0.2440 
$0.2000 $0.2000 
$2.8838 $2.9213 

$0 0032( $0.00320 
$0.00214, $0.002143 

$0.0100 $0.0100 
$0.01534 $0.01534 
$2.8991 $2.9366 

$1 ,667,007.23 $1 ,688,569.73 

Upcharge Upcharge 
$0.0800 $0.0475 
$2.4855 $2.4855 
$2.5655 $2.5330 

$0.1830 $0.1830 
$0.2000 $0.2000 
$2.9485 $2.9160 

$0.00320 $0.00320 
$0.002143 $0.002143 

$0.0100 $0.0100 
$0.01534 $0.01534 

$2.9638 $2.9313 
$326,022.73 $322,447.73 

Net 30 Net 30 
$1 ,993,029.96 $2,011 ,017.46 
$1 993 029.96 


